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Youth, gender and reproductive justice: health inequities 
in family planning in Brazil’s Unified Health System

Abstract  Sexual initiation is a gradual process 
of experimentation and learning the cultural rep-
ertoire of gender, reproduction, contraception, 
sexual violence and other topics surrounding 
youth sociability. Unlike sexual abstinence-based 
approaches promoted as a panacea for reducing 
“early pregnancy” in Brazil, reproductive justice 
is posited as a framework for addressing health 
inequities in family planning. This article discuss-
es the challenges faced by public health policies in 
supporting adolescents and young people in their 
sexual and reproductive trajectories, drawing on 
the concept of intersectionality. We focus on pub-
lic institutional initiatives providing long-acting 
reversible contraceptives (LARC) on the Brazilian 
Unified Health System (SUS) implemented over 
the last decade. We conducted a documentary 
anthropological study drawing on empirical data 
on contraceptive technologies in order to prob-
lematize what we call the “selective provision” of 
these devices and discriminatory and stigmatizing 
practices. Advocating the expansion of the provi-
sion of contraception on the SUS, with universal 
access to LARC for all women, distances itself 
from what we call “contraceptive coercion” among 
specific social groups.
Key words  Youth, Long-acting reversible contra-
ceptives, Intersectionality, Reproductive health
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Introduction

Sexual initiation is a gradual process of experi-
mentation and learning the cultural repertoire of 
gender, reproduction, contraception, sexual vio-
lence and other topics surrounding youth socia-
bility. Unlike sexual abstinence-based approaches 
promoted as a panacea for reducing “early preg-
nancy” in Brazil1, reproductive justice is posited 
as a framework for addressing health inequities in 
family planning. 

The theme of adolescent pregnancy regained 
prominence in a recent public debate in Brazil2,3. 
Most analysts agree that theoretical and sociopo-
litical perspectives affirming and guaranteeing 
adolescents’ and young people’s sexual and repro-
ductive rights – secured over decades of feminist 
and LGBT+ social activism, arduous diplomatic 
efforts during United Nations conferences, and 
formulation of youth health policies4,5 – should 
prevail as a parameter of respect for human rights.

However, an important shift has taken pace 
over recent decades towards the problematiza-
tion of the structural obstacles to protecting these 
rights, especially those of poor black women 
living in contexts of extreme inequality6. Advo-
cacy underpinned by the legal principles under-
lying sexual and reproductive rights is essential 
to guaranteeing the autonomy of subjects (men 
and women) in making sexual and reproductive 
choices. However, the link between the right to 
sexual and reproductive autonomy and the indi-
vidualistic liberal paradigm obscures the struc-
tural racism in so-called democratic societies, 
which imposes often-insurmountable obstacles 
to the right to choose and to access medical prod-
ucts and health services among specific groups. In 
dialogue with intersectionality7,8 – the overlapping 
of social hierarchies such as class, race, gender, 
sexuality, ethnicity, age, nationality, magnifying 
existing and producing new complex forms of 
discrimination – reproductive justice advocates 
for social justice for traditionally excluded groups 
of women. This includes the state guaranteeing 
other social rights, such as education, housing, 
employment, food and other basic needs that are 
fundamental to a dignified life. The reproductive 
justice approach seeks to broaden the struggle for 
the right to abortion – a central element of the 
pro-choice movement in the United States – to 
include the right to have and parent a child with 
dignity, in the case of imprisoned and homeless 
women for example9,10.

Reproductive health issues affecting young 
black women include major difficulties in access-

ing health services, undignified conditions during 
childbirth11, suffering and maltreatment during 
post-abortion care12, as well as a myriad of legal, 
judicial and social care procedures that, despite 
supposedly protecting their interests, deny their 
sexual and reproductive freedom, criminalizing 
reproductive practices and coercively interfering 
with their bodies. Government technologies con-
trol their bodies, punish their reproductive deci-
sions and confiscate their children, among other 
arbitrary actions13-15.

This discussion is by no means new. Respect-
ed feminist intellectuals and black activists16,17 
have done research on this topic, raising aware-
ness and drawing attention to the need to identi-
fy institutional racism as a driver of certain pub-
lic policies.

Drawing on the understanding of reproduc-
tive justice, this analysis of family planning in 
Brazil seeks to show how the expansion of med-
icalization in exclusionary and highly unequal 
societies is socially stratified, gendered and racial-
ized18-20. To this end, we take hormonal long-act-
ing reversible contraceptives (LARC) as an object 
of study to reflect upon the necessary expansion 
of the provision of contraception through Brazil’s 
Unified Health System, the Sistema Único de Saúde 
(SUS), and how these methods are provided.

This article discusses the challenges faced by 
public health policies in supporting adolescents 
and young people in their sexual and reproduc-
tive trajectories, focusing on public institutional 
initiatives providing LARC through the SUS over 
the last decade. We seek to problematize what we 
call the “selective provision” of these devices, and 
the discriminatory and stigmatizing practices 
among certain social groups that we denominate 
“contraceptive coercion”.

Reproductive justice and LARC 

The use of biomedical technologies (contra-
ceptive and other) in clinical studies with popu-
lations considered “vulnerable” is not new in Bra-
zil21,22. Almost always the appeal used by health 
professionals, public health managers and phar-
maceutical companies to promote initiatives that 
seek to mediate access to new biomedical tech-
nologies (generally costly for wide-scale use) to 
specific groups focuses on sexual and reproduc-
tive rights, encapsulating a hegemonic political 
discourse that aims to guarantee young women’s 
fundamental rights. The consumption of certain 
biomedical devices is promoted as a kind of pass-
port to citizenship and modernity, without the 
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contribution of social policies to transform living 
conditions.

Although LARC are recommended by medical 
associations and international organizations23,24 
as highly effective, their wide-scale utilization 
should not be seen as the only way of tackling 
reproductive health inequities. In a recent edito-
rial in the American Journal of Public Health25, 
renowned scholars from the field of social stud-
ies of science, gender and reproduction discuss 
the American Academy of Pediatrics recommen-
dation stating that LARC should be “first-line 
contraceptive choices” for adolescents and young 
adults. The authors criticize the reduction of teen 
pregnancy prevention efforts to individual level 
behavior interventions, perpetuating structural 
injustices. They suggest caution in adopting the 
recommendation of LARC for adolescents, draw-
ing attention to the race and class biases that these 
apparent solutions may give rise to by limiting re-
productive autonomy. They go on to advocate for 
“an approach to LARC informed by reproductive 
justice and predicated on the equal value of all 
lives”25(p.18).

Contraceptive coercion: a fundamental 
sociological category for examining public 
policies

Seeking to unravel the genealogy of the term 
“contraceptive coercion” in family planning pro-
grams in the post-Cairo era, Senderowicz26 shows 
the sophistication that the category can acquire 
when it distances itself from a simplistic under-
standing that equates contraceptive coercion 
with an act of violence perpetrated by one person 
against another. Drawing on the reproductive jus-
tice framework, the author points to a hidden di-
mension of structural processes related to health 
systems and state agents (such as quotas, targets, 
indicators, costs, calculations and estimates) me-
diated by apparently neutral individual technical 
interventions.

The author posits that contraceptive coercion 
gains a bi-directional force that can be exerted to 
influence women to use methods they may not 
want or keep them from accessing wanted meth-
ods, commonly known as “barriers to access” or 
“provider bias”. These are often more apparent in 
the stigmatization of unmarried adolescents and 
young people in relation to the exercise of their 
sexuality. 

Senderowicz26 warns of a range of practices 
that we commonly fail to recognize as coercive, 
but which limit female reproductive autonomy, 

such as the restricted provision of contraceptive 
methods, failing to consider the needs of women 
in different relational, sociocultural and genera-
tional contexts. According to the author, there is a 
spectrum of structural and interpersonal practic-
es, such as the provision of only partial medical 
information (advantages of the method with-
out mentioning side-effects), biased or directive 
counseling, limited method mix, insistence on 
the use of the method offered, threats to women 
about future care if they decline the method, in-
sertion of methods without women’s consent or 
knowledge, especially in the postpartum period, 
refusal to remove LARC, among others26. 

Reflecting on the institutional strategies that 
prevail in family planning in the country and the 
nuances of “contraceptive coercion”, we ques-
tion whether health inequities, class, race and 
gender inequalities are taken into account in 
the provision of contraceptive methods on the 
SUS, respecting the specific characteristics and 
needs of young people living in extreme pover-
ty and reproductive (in)justice. Our argument is 
underpinned by the observation that the choice 
of alternative contraceptive methods available 
on the SUS, such as tubal ligation, is restricted 
and that services take a directive approach to the 
provision of LARC for certain groups of women, 
going against the principle of universal access to 
contraception, regardless of age.

Method

We conducted a documentary anthropological 
study using open-access sources available on the 
internet. This study is part of a project titled “Sex-
ual and reproductive rights in debate: unravelling 
meanings and the social uses of biomedical de-
vices for female contraception and sterilization”, 
in dialogue with the project “Youth, sexuality and 
reproduction: a study of changes and perma-
nence in the sexual and reproductive trajecto-
ries of young Brazilians in the context of social 
relations mediated by social media”, coordinat-
ed by the authors. In this first phase of the re-
search, we looked at electronic media news about 
LARC devices and reviewed empirical data, such 
as legal and institutional documents addressing 
the availability of these devices in public health 
services (bills, decrees, protocols, etc.), academic 
papers and position papers issued by civil society 
organizations, among others. 

LARC methods are still not widely available 
on the SUS for all women. Here we refer to sub-
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dermal etonogestrel implants (known as ge-
nerically as Implanon®), which last up 
to three years, and the levonorgestrel-re-
leasing intrauterine system (Mirena® IUD), 
which is effective for five years. This article 
analyzes the data collected from the above sourc-
es focusing especially on specific groups selected 
to receive these devices through public initiatives, 
denominated by the categories “adolescents”, 
“vulnerable women” and “women at risk” to con-
figure what we call the “selective provision” of 
these contraceptive methods on the SUS. We do 
not intend to examine the operationalization of 
each initiative, but rather seek to show how pub-
lic managers promote these methods by only em-
phasizing their benefits and advantages for users.

The categories that emerge from the empiri-
cal data make us wonder whether there is an un-
derlying social classification simplistically associ-
ated with high rates of maternal morbidity and 
mortality, adolescent or unplanned pregnancy, 
sexually transmitted infections and poverty, and 
the inability of certain women to take care of 
themselves, thus avoiding pregnancy. In the face 
of female indiscipline, government technologies 
are used to transfer responsibility to the state and 
its biomedical apparatus.

We adopt the concept of “contraceptive coer-
cion”26 to analyze the subjection identified in the 
publicity for these initiatives, which systematical-
ly target young black poor and socially excluded 
women, while enthusiastically announcing the 
initiatives as measures that promote the “care” 
and “protection” of users.

Results

Institutional initiatives providing LARC on 
the SUS

We have repeatedly witnessed through me-
dia coverage institutional initiatives providing 
LARC through public health services. Developed 
mainly at state and local level, these initiatives 
are sparse and have a peculiar feature: they target 
specific groups of women considered “apt” to use 
this contraceptive method. In general, they are 
adolescents or young people who are homeless, 
drug users or chemically dependent, incarcerated 
or with HIV.

Three public LARC initiatives exemplify our 
argument: an initiative in the State of Ceará, in 
the Northeast of Brazil, which has been promot-
ing the insertion of these methods in the capital 

and small towns since 2010; an initiative in the 
City of São Paulo, which recently introduced a 
municipal law governing LARC; and an initiative 
implemented in 2018 in the State of Rio Grande 
do Sul, involving adolescents in residential care 
(which had national repercussions). 

The following headline published in the re-
gional newspaper, the Diário do Nordeste, on 22 
September 2010 is noteworthy: “CE is the first 
[state] in Brazil to use contraceptive implants”27. 
With an enthusiastic tone, the article reports the 
provision of subdermal implants through the 
state health department (SESA) “special family 
planning” program, highlighting that “it” helps 
avoid “unwanted pregnancy and, primarily, ma-
ternal death”. The text says that “initially, the 
medication is being used in women receiving 
treatment at the Dr. César Cals General Hospi-
tal, part of the state high-risk pregnancy care re-
ferral network”, but will be gradually distributed 
throughout the state via regional health offices. 

Although family planning is always present-
ed with a consensus justification that is difficult to 
contest, such as the reduction of maternal mor-
tality, an examination of a public statement made 
by the program coordinator reveals ulterior in-
tentions:

According to the obstetrician responsible for 
Women’s Health at the SESA [...], the adminis-
tration of these medications to these adolescents 
is important, since they often forget to take daily 
contraceptives and are more prone to unwanted 
pregnancy. “The Implanon offered by SESA is tar-
geted mainly at adolescents, women with sexually 
transmitted diseases, chemically dependent persons 
and prisoners”27.

In July 2016, two other reports highlighted 
the provision of contraceptive implants to wom-
en in Ceará “at social risk”28,29. In one of the re-
ports, the supervisor of the Women’s Health Unit 
used arguments like forgetting to take the contra-
ceptive pill or lack of proper self-care, which re-
sults in “clandestine abortions or leaving school 
to look after the baby”. He goes on to emphasize: 
“In addition, this is one of the best methods for 
them, because it’s continuous and adolescents 
don’t use condoms”28. 

A partnership between the State Justice De-
partment and Special Secretariat for Drug Policy 
with the support of the Ceará Society of Obstet-
rics and Gynecology, the program in Ceará tar-
gets “vulnerable women”, more specifically, ado-
lescents aged between 15 and 19 years, women of 
reproductive age deprived of liberty and chemi-
cally dependent women.
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The state government’s website defends the 
use of LARC for “vulnerable populations” or 
groups that encounter difficulties in accessing 
health services, particularly in the postpartum 
period, ensuring a “reduction in unplanned preg-
nancies and safe interpregnancy intervals (more 
than 18 months)”; and also for “adolescents and 
users of alcohol and/or other drugs”, who leave 
“the maternity facility with their family planning 
[problem] already resolved”29.

In December 2017, the City of São Pau-
lo’s legislature approved a Bill governing LARC 
(No.467/2015) presented in 2015 by the city coun-
cilor P. Bezerra (PSDB)30. On 19 January 2018, the 
mayor of São Paulo sanctioned Law 16.806 that 
“Governs the policy for the protection of vulnera-
ble women by the public health care network with 
the use of etonogestrel long-acting reversible 
contraceptives and other provisions” (emphasis 
added)31. The justification for this initiative is 
based on health indicators such as a reduction in 
the number of unplanned pregnancies and infant 
and maternal mortality rates. “Chemically depen-
dent persons, the homeless and adolescents will 
be given priority in the free distribution [of the 
contraceptive] through both the conventional 
public network and contracted organizations”32.

In February 2016, after the implementation of 
a pilot project in a municipal maternity hospital, 
the city health department (SMS-SP) announced 
the purchase of 1,000 contraceptive implants 
aimed at expanding distribution through the 
public health network, signaling the savings these 
devices could provide.

In a statement published by the SMS-SP, 
the recurring argument for recommending this 
method reappers33: the fact that they are long-act-
ing means they offer long-term (three years) pro-
tection against pregnancy and “do not require 
discipline because they are not used on a daily ba-
sis”. Although the statement emphasizes that the 
contraceptives can “be interrupted at any time if 
there is a desire to get pregnant, quickly restor-
ing fertility soon after removal”, it fails to explain 
that removal is doctor-dependent, meaning that 
the user has to find a doctor who will perform the 
procedure free of charge.

Little more than a year after its introduction 
(January 2018), Decree Nº 58.693 (2 April 2019)34 
was published to regulate Law Nº 16.806. Article 
1 provides:

Vulnerable women in the City of São Paulo 
receiving treatment through the public health net-
work in direct or contracted centers will have the 
right to the insertion of etonogestrel long-acting 

reversible contraceptive implants free of charge, in 
accordance with the city health department proto-
col and respecting their freedom of choice34 (em-
phasis added).

Article 2 goes on to specify that “vulnerable 
women” include chemically dependent persons, 
homeless women and “adolescents living in re-
gions with a very high level of social vulnerability, 
as defined by the São Paulo Social Vulnerability 
Index (IPVS 2010), developed by the Fundação 
SEADE (state data analysis foundation)”. Finally, 
Article 3 seems to redress any potential distor-
tions or misinterpretations that the law leaves 
open when it provides that “Users should be in-
formed by qualified professionals from referral 
health facilities belonging to the municipal health 
care network about the benefits, risks, side-effects 
and duration of this contraceptive method”. The 
original bill from 2015 contained a sole paragraph 
with an exhaustive list of categories of women 
considered to be “socially vulnerable” (sex work-
ers, women with HIV, adolescents aged under 17 
who have had previous pregnancies or with “low 
adherence to health services”, etc.). The list was 
vetoed by the mayor when he sanctioned the law. 

The last example is a recent initiative in Porto 
Alegre, capital of the State of Rio Grande do Sul, 
which sparked uproar among civil society organi-
zations, feminists, the Municipal Health Council, 
and other actors involved in health policy mak-
ing. The State Public Prosecutor’s Office publi-
cized a “Cooperation Agreement” between Porto 
Alegre City Council’s Department of Health35,36, 
two public hospitals – one of which a university 
hospital – and the pharmaceutical company Bayer 
to insert 100 five-year intrauterine systems (SIU-
LNG) in adolescents in state residential care.

The news triggered a series of protests and 
criticism, signaling that the “Cooperation Agree-
ment” had gone over social control agencies/
organizations that debate on population health 
issues37,38. The two-year agreement envisaged 
check-ups 45 days after insertion, but failed to 
outline how the follow-up of the adolescents 
would be carried out over the five-year period 
(period of effectiveness of the device) or how 
they would get the method removed at the end of 
this period, especially considering that they only 
remain in care until the age of 18. In April 2019, 
the Regional Federal Court suspended the agree-
ment39.

This event brings up an earlier initiative 
(2006) in Porto Alegre – also with the Depart-
ment of Health’s stamp of approval – involving 
the insertion of 2,500 contraceptive implants in 
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adolescents aged between 15 and 18 years in 10 
underprivileged neighborhoods40. At the time, 
political leaders, feminist organizations and 
groups defending the rights of children and ado-
lescents joined forces to discuss the intervention, 
questioning its legitimacy by claiming that it vi-
olated the adolescents’ rights41. The initiative was 
implemented despite a public debate on the city’s 
adolescent health care policies, being suspended 
the following year by court order.

The category “socially vulnerable women” 
tends to be the “magic key” or “free pass” used to 
justify family planning actions based on the logic 
of the state, specifically targeting adolescents and 
young people. The appropriateness of the term, 
which serves various political interests and is 
open to subjective interpretations, is at the very 
least questionable. For example, why are wom-
en who experience intimate partner violence 
not mentioned as targets of these programs? Are 
they not at social risk? Why is reproduction on 
the fringe of the periphery such a major concern? 
Shouldn’t the fact that there are people who live 
their whole life in social exclusion cause greater 
indignation on the part of the state?

Discussion

“Selective provision” of LARC: the fine line 
between expansion and violation of rights

Although LARC initiatives are supported by 
health indicators, the coercive face of these ini-
tiatives appears evident to us: actions target spe-
cific groups of women (adolescents, homeless 
persons, chemically dependent persons, etc.) that 
find themselves in precarious living conditions 
and too fragile to stand up to medical/state pow-
er if they do not want to use LARC. 

This coercive face is cloaked in terms such 
as “protecting the health” of socially vulnerable 
women. The documents analyzed in this study 
fail to mention training of technical and pro-
fessional staff in sexuality education, including 
issues of gender and sexual violence. Training is 
only provided for device insertion. The focus ap-
pears to be promoting the use of LARC to save 
spending resources on “risky motherhood”13. 
There is an assumed greater need for interven-
tion and the instrumentalization of these wom-
en’s bodies to reduce greater harm associated 
with reproduction between poor black people.

A previous study discusses a request made 
by the Brazilian Federation of Gynecology and 

Obstetrics Associations (FEBRASGO) to the 
Ministry of Health in 2015 to incorporate these 
contraceptive technologies into the SUS for use 
with “special populations” (young women 
aged between 15 and 19 years)42. The request was 
denied at that time. One of the underlying jus-
tifications for the request was that these young 
women were unable to control their fertility and 
take care of themselves, meaning that it would be 
more effective to transfer this responsibility to 
doctors, for a reasonable length of time (three to 
five years), through the insertion of these meth-
ods.

The analysis of the initiatives presented here 
reveals a context in which adolescents and young 
people are at the mercy of the discernment of 
health professionals, their values and moral 
judgments and racial and class prejudice towards 
these women and their “deviant” sexual and re-
productive behavior. It is therefore necessary to 
reveal what is hidden in such initiatives: some 
“types of motherhood are possible”, while others 
are not. 

In Brazil we therefore oscillate between stop-
ping teenage sex (see the public debate men-
tioned above) or proposing measures to prevent 
adolescent pregnancy dressed up as measures to 
“protect vulnerable adolescents”, in which the 
selective provision of LARC is the most prag-
matic path. The simple provision of informed 
consent (by the adolescent or young woman and/
or parent/guardian) to guarantee “voluntary ad-
herence” to LARC and other important ethical 
questions need to be problematized, in view of 
the difficulties encountered by people without 
formal scientific education in understanding 
technical terms and the methods used by health 
professionals to convince women to use these 
methods, often taking advantage of patient-pro-
vider power hierarchies. This ethical debate 
seems to be rather silenced in this country.

It is impossible not to add the demographic 
debate surrounding the juvenilization of repro-
duction in Brazil to this context and its implica-
tions over the last two decades stemming from 
the Family Planning Law43. The demographic 
transition in Brazil has not resulted in the post-
ponement of parenthood, but rather the country 
has maintained a young fertility profile (20-24-
year and 15-19-year age groups)44. Alongside 
this phenomenon, the high rate of unplanned 
pregnancies prevails, together with the problem 
of untimely pregnancies. The regulation of vol-
untary sterilization by the Family Planning Law 
established criteria for performing surgeries in 
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the country (women aged over 25 years or with 
at least two children). However, this action has 
been accompanied by some unexpected develop-
ments. 

On the one hand, the initiative was consid-
ered as an important step forward in terms of 
the democratization of access to procedures 
(expanding availability for men and curbing the 
“tubal ligation epidemic” among women). How-
ever, the fall in the number of female steriliza-
tions has raised questions as to whether the crite-
ria stipulated for performing tubal ligations has 
led to new barriers to access, especially among 
younger women. Unfortunately, up-to-date in-
formation on contraceptive behavior among the 
population is severely lacking, given that the lat-
est national demographic and health survey was 
conducted in 2006. 

We might wonder whether there is a certain 
gap in the availability of contraceptives due to 
this unexpected dynamic in relation to female 
sterilization, potentially being bridged gradually 
by the “selective provision” of LARC. A frequent 
outcome among women who begin parenthood 
early, sterilization tends to be an appealing con-
traceptive method – especially for those who have 
quickly reached the “number of desired children” 
– and has been proposed countless times as a 
solution to end the reproductive trajectories of 
“abject women”. Currently, LARC represent the 
“ideal method” for postponing (and spacing) 
pregnancy, but may also constitute a potential 
artifact for ending reproductive trajectories in 
certain groups of women. 

Perceived as being in a latent state of “uncon-
trol” and therefore in a permanent state of po-
tential reproduction, women’s bodies “require” 
intervention. These questions lead us back to the 
debate about “social Malthusianism”, not only on 
the part of health professionals, but also in cer-
tain interventions and policies put in place “in 
the name of” the health of women and/or their 
reproductive rights45. The coercive proposition 
of LARC to specific groups of women has been 
added to the historic selective provision of tubal 
ligation. Similarities in these processes make us 
wonder whether strategies are underway to facil-
itate the governmentality of bodies.

Final considerations

Sexual, family planning and reproductive health 
care for adolescents provided by public health 

services should uphold the ethical principles of 
respect for personal integrity and autonomy, 
without the imposition of constraints by health 
professionals. As a public health policy, family 
planning with a specific focus on adolescents and 
young people cannot be done without debate on 
gender, sexuality, and racism and gender-based 
violence in schools, universities and the media. It 
also requires the wide-scale distribution of con-
doms in places where young people socialize, the 
provision of other contraceptive methods (the 
oral contraceptive pill, emergency contracep-
tives, injectable contraceptives, copper IUDs), 
access to safe abortion, tubal ligation and vasec-
tomy, without spouse/partner approval, and sup-
porting young people in their decisions.

Our findings clearly show that, unlike other 
moments in history in which the formulation 
of women’s and young people’s care policies 
involved the active participation of users’ rep-
resentatives in the discussion of their interests, 
currently the main protagonists are medical as-
sociations, public managers and pharmaceuti-
cal companies. It is no coincidence that in 2016 
the non-governmental organization SisterSong 
Women of Color Reproductive Justice Collec-
tive – a cradle of debate on reproductive justice 
in the United States – and the National Women’s 
Health Network published the LARC - Statement 
of Principles, endorsed by numerous women’s 
rights organizations46. The statement advocates 
for the freedom of women and necessary condi-
tions so that the choice of which contraceptive 
method to use can be made “in a medically ethi-
cal and culturally competent manner”.

Finally, the concept of “contraceptive coer-
cion” enabled us to demonstrate how much the 
provision of LARC to specific population groups 
reifies a modus operandi of reproductive con-
trol by various agents of the state across multi-
ple levels. It is important to remember that the 
phenomenon of contraceptive coercion did not 
come about due to the “badness” of health pro-
fessionals. Rather it obeys a broader scheme of 
policy formulation and health service organiza-
tion – often using fiscal incentives, international 
funding and other forms of support – that ends 
up subordinating reproductive autonomy as a 
basic principle of contraceptive programs.

Dressed up in the language of rights, this 
game not only deepens social inequalities among 
women, but also reinforces racism and stigma by 
ignoring the vital need for debate on reproduc-
tive justice.
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